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Todd DelFrate - CalReeycle Grant - Dellar Property _

From: "Mindermann, Wes" <Wes.Mindermann@CalRecycle.ca.gov>
To: "tdelfrate(@waterboards.ca.gov"' <tdelfrate@waterboards.ca.gov>
Date: 4/23/2012 2:38 PM

Subject: CalRecycle Grant - Dellar Property

CC:  "Botan, Mustafe" <Mustafe.Botan@CalRecycle.ca.gov>

Hi Todd:

Thanks for the call today. Below is our understanding of the agreement reached between Dellar and the City of
Sacramento. Asindicated, while the agreement appears acceptable with respect to CalRecycle’s grant with the
City of Sacramento, the necessary contracts need to be completed between Dellar and the City of Sacramento.

In addition, we would expect to receive copies of the agreement.

Also as | mentioned, it is our intent to push these parties to get the site work completed this construction
season. Just FY1, our grant is for S7‘20,500 and expires on May 15, 2014, The contract manager is Mustafe Botan
at{916) 341-6367 or at mustafe hotan@calrecycle.ca.gov.

Good luck in your meeting tomorrow. Please let us know if you get the impression that work is not progressmg
towards completion this year.

Regards - Wes

From: Botan, Mustafe

Sent: Friday, April 20, 2012 2:39 PM

To: 'Karl Kurka'

Cc: Jerry Hicks; Kathleen Rogan; Tim Crandall Jeffory 1. Scharff, Esq.; Mindermann, Wes
Subject: RE: Dellar-CalRecycle Grant

Thanks for the update Karl. This arrangement will work for CalRecycle and at this point | do not see a need for
us to meet next Tuesday. | de not recall any other issues needed more discussion, However, we will need to
reconvene if this proposed arrangement changes.

Regards,

Mustafe Botan, P.E.
Waste Management Engineer

From. Karl Kurka [mailto: KKurka@cityofsacramento.org]

Sent: Friday, April 20, 2012 2:27 PM

To: Botan, Mustafe '
Cc: Jerry Hicks; Kathleen Rogan; Tim Crandall; Jeffory J. Scharff, Esq.
Subject: Dellar-CalRecycIe Grant

Hi Mustafe,

It looks like the City can pay Dellar’s contractors directly. 'm having the necessary contracts completed.
The process would be:
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Tim Crandall oversees implementation {QA work completed).
City and Dellar pay half of each contractor invoice,

City submits proof of payment to CalRecycle.

CalRecycle reimburses City half of each invoice,

Let me know if this arrangement will be satisfactory. If so, do you still want to meet next Tuesday 4/247 Not
sure if there were other issues we need to address. Have a great weekend.

Thanks

Karl Kurka

Environmental Program Manager
Department of General Services
City of Sacramento
916-808-8430
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